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A stunning collection of essays on the craft of biography and autobiography by the acclaimed biographer of
George Bernard Shaw and Lytton Strachey.

Works on Paper is a selection by one of today's leading biographers from his lectures, essays, and reviews
written over the last quarter of a century --mainly on the craft of biography and autobiography but also
covering what Michael Holroyd describes as his "enthusiasms and alibis."

Opening with a startling attack on biography, which is answered by two essays on the ethics and values of
non-fiction writing, the book goes on to examine the work of several contemporary biographers, the place of
biography in fiction and of fiction in biography, and the revelations of some extravagant autobiographers,
from Osbert Sitwell to Quentin Crisp--to which he adds some adventures of his own, in particular an
important and unpublished piece "The Making of GBS," a riveting story of internecine literary warfare.

The book ends with a series of satires, celebrations, apologias, and polemics which throw light not only on
Michael Holroyd's progress as a biographer but also his record as an embattled campaigner in the field of
present-day literary politics.
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From reader reviews:

Nicole Reagan:

The ability that you get from Works on Paper: The Craft of Biography and Autobiography may be the more
deep you excavating the information that hide into the words the more you get serious about reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Works on Paper: The Craft of Biography and
Autobiography giving you joy feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in a number of way that can
be understood by means of anyone who read the item because the author of this reserve is well-known
enough. This specific book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then
can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this Works on
Paper: The Craft of Biography and Autobiography instantly.

Earnest Moss:

This Works on Paper: The Craft of Biography and Autobiography are generally reliable for you who want to
become a successful person, why. The explanation of this Works on Paper: The Craft of Biography and
Autobiography can be one of many great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple
examining food but feed anyone with information that might be will shock your prior knowledge. This book
is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions both in e-book and
printed people. Beside that this Works on Paper: The Craft of Biography and Autobiography giving you an
enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we realize
it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Mary Diaz:

Works on Paper: The Craft of Biography and Autobiography can be one of your beginning books that are
good idea. We recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that can increase your
knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The copy writer
giving his/her effort to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Works on Paper: The Craft of
Biography and Autobiography but doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest as well as
based confirm resource data that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can drawn you
into brand new stage of crucial imagining.

Christopher Arnold:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Works on Paper: The Craft of
Biography and Autobiography which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.
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