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 From the internationally bestselling author of The House at Riverton, an unforgettable new novel that
transports the reader from the back alleys of poverty of pre-World War I London to the shores of
colonial Australia where so many made a fresh start, and back to the windswept coast of Cornwall,
England, past and present 

A tiny girl is abandoned on a ship headed for Australia in 1913. She arrives completely alone with nothing
but a small suitcase containing a few clothes and a single book -- a beautiful volume of fairy tales. She is
taken in by the dockmaster and his wife and raised as their own. On her twenty-first birthday they tell her the
truth, and with her sense of self shattered and with very little to go on, "Nell" sets out on a journey to
England to try to trace her story, to fi nd her real identity. Her quest leads her to Blackhurst Manor on the
Cornish coast and the secrets of the doomed Mountrachet family. But it is not until her granddaughter,
Cassandra, takes up the search after Nell's death that all the pieces of the puzzle are assembled. At Cliff
Cottage, on the grounds of Blackhurst Manor, Cassandra discovers the forgotten garden of the book's title
and is able to unlock the secrets of the beautiful book of fairy tales.

This is a novel of outer and inner journeys and an homage to the power of storytelling. The Forgotten
Garden is filled with unforgettable characters who weave their way through its spellbinding plot to
astounding effect.

Morton's novels are #1 bestsellers in England and Australia and are published in more than twenty
languages. Her fi rst novel, The House at Riverton, was a New York Times bestseller.
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From reader reviews:

Lee Rutledge:

The book The Forgotten Garden: A Novel can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book The Forgotten
Garden: A Novel? Wide variety you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can
give many data for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or
details that you take for that, you can give for each other; you may share all of these. Book The Forgotten
Garden: A Novel has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the
enormous world by open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Alberto Redden:

The actual book The Forgotten Garden: A Novel has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to
read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was published by the very famous author. The author
makes some research prior to write this book. This book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
reading this article book.

Frederick Cagle:

Many people spending their time by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It ok you can have
the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like The Forgotten Garden: A Novel which is
having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Lisa Madruga:

As a college student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library
as well as to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's
spirit or real their hobby. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to generally
there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't
see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this The Forgotten Garden: A Novel can make you really feel more interested to read.
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