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As farms increase in size and become increasingly industrialized, the problem of agricultural pollution is
gaining urgency across Canada. The response from most environmentalists and provincial governments is to
push for more centralized regulation. In Greener Pastures, Elizabeth Brubaker exposes the detrimental effects
of such regulatory changes, which tend to exacerbate, rather than curb, pollution.

For centuries, Brubaker explains, conflicts about farming were resolved by the parties directly involved,
aided by common-law courts. The rule, 'use your own property so as not to harm another's,' fairly and
effectively resolved disputes between farmers and their neighbours and curbed environmental damage.
Beginning in the 1970s, however, concerns about restraints on agriculture's growth prompted governments to
replace the common law with more permissive provincial statutes.

Greener Pastures chronicles the centralization of agricultural regulation and the resulting environmental
harm. Brubaker focuses, specifically, on the right-to-farm laws (passed by every province in recent decades)
that have freed farmers from common-law liability for the nuisances they create. She shows how these laws
have made possible an unsustainable intensification of agriculture, and argues for a decentralized, rights-
based decision-making regime. This thoroughly researched and impressively thought-out study challenges
many common assumptions about environmental regulation, and proposes fresh answers to grave
environmental and political questions.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Lowe:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called Greener
Pastures (U of T Centre for Public Management Series on Public Policy & Administration)? Maybe it is to
get best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book,
you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different opinion?

Emmaline Jett:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to you is you don't know what one you should start with. This Greener Pastures (U of T
Centre for Public Management Series on Public Policy & Administration) is our recommendation to cause
you to keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Joseph Mattie:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with their story or their
experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write about the knowledge about
something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young ones,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their expertise in
writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this Greener
Pastures (U of T Centre for Public Management Series on Public Policy & Administration).

Tyler Dean:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Greener Pastures (U of T Centre for
Public Management Series on Public Policy & Administration) book written by well-known writer who
really knows well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written
with good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your hunger
then you still uncertainty Greener Pastures (U of T Centre for Public Management Series on Public Policy &
Administration) as good book not merely by the cover but also by the content. This is one guide that can
break don't judge book by its cover, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh
come on your reading through sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth
sense.
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