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In A History of Egypt, Jason Thompson has written the first one-volume work to encompass all 5,000 years
of Egyptian history, highlighting the surprisingly strong connections between the ancient land of the
Pharaohs and the modern-day Arab nation. 

No country's past can match Egypt's in antiquity, richness, and variety. However, it is rarely presented as a
comprehensive panorama because scholars tend to divide it into distinct eras—prehistoric, pharaonic, Greco-
Roman, Coptic, medieval Islamic, Ottoman, and modern—that are not often studied in relation to one
another. In this daringly ambitious project, drawing on the most current scholarship as well as his own
research, Thompson makes the case that few if any other countries have as many threads of continuity
running through their entire historical experience. With its unprecedented scope and lively and readable
style, A History of Egypt offers students, travelers, and general readers alike an engaging narrative of the
extraordinarily long course of human history by the Nile. 
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Watson:

The book with title A History of Egypt: From Earliest Times to the Present has lot of information that you
can learn it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the information
that exist in this book represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out
how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you throughout new era of the globalization.
You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Martin Elkins:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get lot of
stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are there when
the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you try this
one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the particular book you
have read is actually A History of Egypt: From Earliest Times to the Present.

Jerri Montgomery:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. On the
list of books in the top record in your reading list is definitely A History of Egypt: From Earliest Times to the
Present. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious
person. By looking right up and review this book you can get many advantages.

Luther Jensen:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the book A History of Egypt: From Earliest Times to the
Present to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is developing when you
just like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the feeling about
book and looking at especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book and examine it.
Beside that the publication A History of Egypt: From Earliest Times to the Present can to be your friend
when you're truly feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of this time.
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