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Price of Love by Shelley MunroTiger Kersen Amat wants to marry leopard Jarita Namar. All he needs to do
is find rubies for the bride price and woo the sexy shifter. Unknown to him Jarita is already interested. When
they meet in the Burmese jungle sparks fly along with love and laughter. Mutual pleasure explodes-sweet,
erotic and compelling-until thieves intent on stealing rubies intrude. A disaster since without the gems there's
no bride price and their courtship will be doomed. Obtaining Jarita, a jewel beyond price, as his mate might
take more than rubies and seduction. . . Masters of Illusionby Tawny TaylorIllusion. A word shaded with
nuance, making the men who practice it-the masters-enigmas. Particularly when they magically materialize
from the shadows of a woman's dark past.It's been fifteen years. No longer the tormented young men Blair
knew and loved so long ago, Damon and Trey still know how to touch her heart, how to draw out her secrets,
and how to bring her to the edge of ecstasy.Blair has two weeks to unravel the mystery of the ruby and
decide if the magic her seductive masters are wielding is real or illusion. The answers to her questions are
hidden within the facets of the ruby gifts she receives each night, the mysteries veiled by their illusions. .
.and the dark desires burning in her body.Reader advisory: This book contains scenes with same-gender sex,
and references to child abuse. Primal Urgeby Elyssa LynneFor six years Guerrin has become a werewolf,
mindlessly killing every full moon. But one night he encounters Marya, and his urge to mate with her is so
strong, he reverts to human form-thus beginning a magic spell that is his only hope of salvation.If Guerrin
and Marya can construct a collar of steel, silver and a ruby and fasten it about his neck at the moment he is
both wolf and man, he will retain his own mind even in wolf shape. To complete the spell, each step must be
accompanied by sex-a major distraction. Time is running out and if they
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From reader reviews:

Adam Jones:

This Risque Ruby book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The
benefit you have by reading this book is definitely information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get
details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Risque Ruby
without we comprehend teach the one who reading it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't
always be worry Risque Ruby can bring once you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn
out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even phone. This Risque Ruby having great
arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Frankie Evans:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside
the book that improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of book
you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want sense
happy read one using theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the Risque Ruby is kind of reserve
which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Benjamin Martinez:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book compared
to can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book that need
more time to be learn. Risque Ruby can be your answer since it can be read by anyone who have those short
extra time problems.

Larry Artz:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's internal or real their
pastime. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Risque Ruby can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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