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In the summer of 1986 Cathryn Lewis felt that something was missing from her life. What was it? A
romantic relationship and eventually, companionship! Although involved in church ministries she was not
satisfied.
What must she do? Was it her fault? She thought to herself “I did not take up offers that were presented to
me; but some men can be cruel, unfaithful and abusive. The honest, kind and caring ones seem to be all
taken!” She wrestled with this new feeling and sought God’s answers.
Along came Matt. Through a series of orchestrated events including an accident, and hospitalizations where
“I will marry you event if you come out in a wheel chair” was whispered, Cathryn was convinced that their
meeting was “Not by Chance”.

This is the first in the series of novella 'God answers prayer'.
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From reader reviews:

Jesse Reid:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get a lot
of information that could give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their skill
in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this Not By Chance
(God Answers Prayer Book 1).

Robert Holt:

The book Not By Chance (God Answers Prayer Book 1) has a lot info on it. So when you check out this
book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes some
research before write this book. That book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this
article book.

Joyce Martinez:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer is usually Not By Chance (God Answers Prayer Book 1)
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you
actually. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense
will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Rose Heck:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or make summary
for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real their leisure
activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Not By Chance (God Answers Prayer Book 1) can make you experience more
interested to read.
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