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Of all the games ever played in a sporting competition, never has an event been so bizarre and yet so
fitting for its historical moment: the 1968 Masters.

Anger gripped America's heart in April 1968. Vietnam and a bitter presidential contest sharpened the divides
between races and generations, while protests and violence poisened the air. Then an assassin's bullet took
the life of Dr. Martin Luther King, Jr. Cities burned.
     The smoke had barely cleared when the Masters began.
     Never was the country more ready for distraction and escape--but could the orderly annual excitement of
Palmer versus Nicklaus provide it? For a while, it could and it did--except that instead of a duel between
golf's superstars, several unlikely members of the chorus stepped forward with once-in-a-lifetime
performances. There was blunt-talking Bob Goalby, a truck driver's son from Illinois and former star football
player; loveable Roberto De Vicenzo from Argentina, who charmed the galleries and media all week; and
Bert Yancey, a Floridian who'd dropped out of West Point to face his private demons of mental illness.
     Just as the competition reached a thrilling crescendo, it all fell apart. The Masters, the best-run
tournament in the world, devolved into a heart-wrenching tangle of rules, responsibility, and technicality. In
a fascinating narrative that stops in Augusta, Buenos Aires, and Belleville, Illinois, bestselling author Curt
Sampson finds the truth behind The Lost Masters. It's a story you'll never forget.
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From reader reviews:

Louis Jackson:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As you
may know that book is very important for us. The book The Lost Masters: Grace and Disgrace in '68 has
been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is
rather advantages for you. The e-book The Lost Masters: Grace and Disgrace in '68 is not only giving you a
lot more new information but also to become your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your current
spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with the book The Lost Masters: Grace and Disgrace
in '68. You never feel lose out for everything should you read some books.

Fatima Leonard:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of
new details. When you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of various
ways to share the information as well as their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially hype book the author will bring someone to imagine the
story how the characters do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other folks. When
you read this The Lost Masters: Grace and Disgrace in '68, you can tells your family, friends as well as soon
about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a e-book.

Jack Williams:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Lost Masters: Grace
and Disgrace in '68 can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
guides have than the others?

Jesus Rhode:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This guide The Lost Masters: Grace and Disgrace in '68 was filled with regards to science.
Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has various feel
when they reading the book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a
book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you wanted.
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