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Drama / 10m, 3f -casting may vary / Simple Set Winner of the 2008 Keene Prize for Literature Winner of the
2008 David Mark Cohen National Playwriting Award Elephant's Graveyard is the true tale of the tragic
collision of a struggling circus and a tiny town in Tennessee, which resulted in the only known lynching of
an elephant. Set in September of 1916, the play combines historical fact and legend, exploring the deep-
seated American craving for spectacle, violence and revenge. This abridged version, which runs about 40
minutes in length, is perfect for high schools looking to perform the play at theatre competitions or for
producers looking for a shorter version of the original script. Adapted by the author, it maintains the haunting
drama of the award-winning full length play. "The script is, like the best art, microscopically specific with
echoes that radiate outward across time. Elephant's Graveyard buzzes with truth about the consequences of
misunderstanding, the invisible but enormous gap between artists and their audiences, and the infernal
beauty of vaudeville." -The Stranger, Seattle "A theatrical masterpiece." -Columbia City Paper "The most
striking production in the (NSDF) festival." -Times of London "Deeply moving...has the audience in stitches
at the open and tears at the close." -TheSunCoast.com
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From reader reviews:

Cortney Roller:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not hoping Elephant S Graveyard Abridged
Version that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading habit
all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world a great deal better then how they react to
the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading routine only for the geeky particular person but for
all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good
habit, you are able to pick Elephant S Graveyard Abridged Version become your starter.

Anita Pfeifer:

You can spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This Elephant S Graveyard Abridged Version is
simple to bring you can read it in the area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not possess much
space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you easier to read it.
You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when
one buys this book.

Jack Young:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This publication Elephant S Graveyard Abridged Version was filled regarding science.
Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has diverse
feel when they reading a book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a
book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book you wanted.

Lee Villegas:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of news.
On this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
just like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the Elephant S Graveyard Abridged Version when you required it?
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