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Fobbit /’fä-bit/, noun. Definition: A U.S. soldier stationed at a Forward Operating Base who avoids
combat by remaining at the base, esp. during Operation Iraqi Freedom (2003-2011). Pejorative.

In the satirical tradition of Catch-22 and M*A*S*H, Fobbit takes us into the chaotic world of Baghdad’s
Forward Operating Base Triumph. The Forward Operating base, or FOB, is like the back-office of the
battlefield – where people eat and sleep, and where a lot of soldiers have what looks suspiciously like a desk
job. Male and female soldiers are trying to find an empty Porta Potty in which to get acquainted, grunts are
playing Xbox and watching NASCAR between missions, and a lot of the senior staff are more concerned
about getting to the chow hall in time for the Friday night all-you-can-eat seafood special than worrying
about little things like military strategy.

Darkly humorous and based on the author's own experiences in Iraq, Fobbit is a fantastic debut that shows us
a behind-the-scenes portrait of the real Iraq war.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Maselli:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or goal; it means that e-book
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Fobbit.

Dena Jacobs:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider
while those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously which
one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then
you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities
will not happen inside you if you take Fobbit as your daily resource information.

Jose Pina:

The book untitled Fobbit is the book that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the
book content that will be shown to a person. The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily
to understand. The article writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, therefore the information
that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Fobbit from the publisher to
make you far more enjoy free time.

Maria Lamotte:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book Fobbit to make your personal reading is
interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is developing when you including reading. Try to choose simple
book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the impression about book and looking at especially. It is to be
1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the book Fobbit can to be your brand
new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of the time.
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