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According to Bertman, just as an individual needs memories to maintain a sense of personal identity, so does
a nation need them in order to survive. Like Alzheimer victims, however, today's Americans are rapidly
losing a consciousness of history, and with it, a sense of national identity and direction.

Sixty percent of adult Americans don't know the name of the president who ordered the dropping of the first
atomic bomb, 42% of college seniors can't place the Civil War in the right half-century, and 24% think
Columbus discovered America in the 1500s. Meanwhile, more American teenagers can name the Three
Stooges than the three branches of the federal government.

Applying the metaphor of Alzheimer's disease to our national state of mind, Bertman offers a chilling
prognosis for our country's future unless radical steps for recovery are taken. He offers psychological
insights into the nature of memory with perspectives on the meaning and future of democracy. With
compelling evidence, the book demonstrates that cultural amnesia, like Alzheimer's disease, is an insidiously
progressive and debilitating illness that is eating away at America's soul. Rather than superficially blaming
memory loss on a failed educational system, Bertman looks beyond the classroom to the larger social forces
that conspire to alienate Americans from their past: a materialistic creed that celebrates transience and
disposability, and an electronic faith that worships the present to the exclusion of all other dimensions of
time.
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From reader reviews:

James Marcus:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or details even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some
of you maybe may update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know which one you should start with. This Cultural Amnesia:
America's Future and the Crisis of Memory is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Janelle Smith:

This book untitled Cultural Amnesia: America's Future and the Crisis of Memory to be one of several books
that best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will
easily to buy this particular book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by using online. The publisher
on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can read this book in
your Smart phone. So there is no reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Edward Brown:

Often the book Cultural Amnesia: America's Future and the Crisis of Memory will bring one to the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new
book to learn, this book very appropriate to you. The book Cultural Amnesia: America's Future and the
Crisis of Memory is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from official web
site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Edward Cottrell:

You can get this Cultural Amnesia: America's Future and the Crisis of Memory by look at the bookstore or
Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you get difficulties to your knowledge.
Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book through e-book.
In the modern era including now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most
important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for
you.
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