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In Going Solo, the world's favourite storyteller, Roald Dahl, tells of life as a fighter pilot in Africa. 'They did
not think for one moment that they would find anything but a burnt-out fuselage and a charred skeleton, and
they were astounded when they came upon my still-breathing body lying in the sand nearby.' In 1938 Roald
Dahl was fresh out of school and bound for his first job in Africa, hoping to find adventure far from home.
However, he got far more excitement than he bargained for when the outbreak of the Second World War led
him to join the RAF. His account of his experiences in Africa, crashing a plane in the Western Desert, rescue
and recovery from his horrific injuries in Alexandria, flying a Hurricane as Greece fell to the Germans, and
many other daring deeds, recreates a world as bizarre and unnerving as any he wrote about in his fiction.
"Very nearly as grotesque as his fiction. The same compulsive blend of wide-eyed innocence and fascination
with danger and horror". (Evening Standard). "A non-stop demonstration of expert raconteurship". (The New
York Times Book Review). Roald Dahl, the brilliant and worldwide acclaimed author of Charlie and the
Chocolate Factory, James and the Giant Peach, Matilda, and many more classics for children, also wrote
scores of short stories for adults. These delightfully disturbing tales have often been filmed and were most
recently the inspiration for the West End play, Roald Dahl's Twisted Tales by Jeremy Dyson. Roald Dahl's
stories continue to make readers shiver today.
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From reader reviews:

David Robinson:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled [(Going Solo)] [Author: Roald Dahl] published on (February,
2012). Try to the actual book [(Going Solo)] [Author: Roald Dahl] published on (February, 2012) as your
friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside regarding course make you
smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you much more confidence
because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me make new experience in addition to
knowledge with this book.

Christopher Suttle:

The book [(Going Solo)] [Author: Roald Dahl] published on (February, 2012) make you feel enjoy for your
spare time. You may use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to become your best
friend when you getting pressure or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make
examining a book [(Going Solo)] [Author: Roald Dahl] published on (February, 2012) to become your habit,
you can get more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about many or all
subjects. You could know everything if you like open up and read a book [(Going Solo)] [Author: Roald
Dahl] published on (February, 2012). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or
encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this book?

Christina Harper:

As people who live in the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or data even knowledge to
make all of them keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know what one you should start with. This [(Going Solo)] [Author: Roald
Dahl] published on (February, 2012) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this
book serves what you want and need in this era.

Shelly Sampson:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading.
Some people likes reading, not only science book but additionally novel and [(Going Solo)] [Author: Roald
Dahl] published on (February, 2012) as well as others sources were given understanding for you. After you
know how the good a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or
students especially. Those books are helping them to bring their knowledge. In various other case, beside
science reserve, any other book likes [(Going Solo)] [Author: Roald Dahl] published on (February, 2012) to



make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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