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Ten Poems to Set You Free inspires you to claim the life that is truly yours. In today’s world it is
deceptively easy to lose sight of our direction and the things that matter and give us joy. How quickly the
days can slip by, the years all gone, and we, at the end of our lives, mourning the life we dreamed of but
never lived. These ten poems, and Roger Housden’s reflections on them, urge us to stand once and for all,
and now, in the heart of our own life.

This volume brings together the voices of Thomas Merton, David Whyte, the Basque poet Miguel de
Unamuno, Anna Swir from Poland, Stanley Kunitz, the Greek poet C. P. Cavafy, and Jane Hirshfield, as well
as three of Housden’s favorites, Rumi, Mary Oliver, and Naomi Shihab Nye. His luminous essays on the
poems show us how to integrate the poets’ truth into our own lives.

Roger Housden’s love of poetry and life leaps from every page—so much so that his readers feel they have
found a guide and mentor through the extraordinary Ten Poems series. He has opened the eyes and hearts of
many, not just to the power of poetry, but to the truth and beauty of the life of the soul. What more can one
ask?
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From reader reviews:

Michael Vu:

This book untitled Ten Poems to Set You Free to be one of several books which best seller in this year,
honestly, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily
to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher of the book sells
the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart
phone. So there is no reason to you to past this book from your list.

Peggy Ross:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family,
or their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic from the
park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your
current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book might be option to fill your free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try out look for
book, may be the e-book untitled Ten Poems to Set You Free can be great book to read. May be it might be
best activity to you.

Jason Cook:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get lots of stress
from both day to day life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely without
a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is actually Ten Poems to Set You Free.

Wayne Joseph:

Beside this specific Ten Poems to Set You Free in your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the
new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from oven so don't end
up being worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Ten Poems to Set
You Free because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you at times have book but
you would not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in
your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still
want to miss that? Find this book and also read it from currently!
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