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This book bridges the gap between a highly quantitative analysis of a process that requires extensive training
(i.e., Six Sigma certification) and a more simplified approach that can be used and understood by the masses
(i.e., Lean thinking). We introduce the familiar healthcare protocol for patient care and safety, the Assess,
Diagnosis, Treat, and Prevent (ADTP) model to be considered as an improvement methodology. This will
assist those in your facility to better understand how Lean and Six Sigma can be successfully deployed.
(NOTE: Please see The Practical Lean Six Sigma Pocket Guide for Healthcare (smaller, 3.5 in. x 5.5 in.) for
the same tools, concepts, etc. arranged in the D-M-A-I-C model for less than 10 dollars!) The goal of this
book is to make the methods and tools of Lean and Six Sigma accessible to more people and provide a
common sense or practical approach to problem solving and continuous improvement. This book is intended
to be used by Sigma Belt Levels, Lean Senseis (i.e., teachers), Continuous Improvement Specialists, front-
line managers, and supervisors of departments and work groups, and improvement team members in their
efforts to improve the patient care experience while reducing waste and variation in all types of healthcare
processes. The Lean Six Sigma tools and concepts are presented relative to the A3 road map to provide a
definitive how-to guide to problem solving and continuous improvement (Kaizen) initiatives.

The examples contained in this book are from a wide range of hospitals, clinics, and physician group
practices, and will assist team members to fully understand the tool s usage and purpose.

Throughout this book, the different improvement methodologies that organizations may already be using to
meet the Joint Commission requirements are recognized and mentioned. We acknowledge that all have their
benefits. It is important to select the one that fits the organization and will be widely used. The methodology
should be easy to understand and follow, therefore better engaging the employees, as well as providing a
visual management structure for reporting and sustaining continuous improvement initiatives.

The examples provided throughout this publication demonstrate how a Lean or Six Sigma tool was used in a
particular setting. We have presented them in this manner to provide a general understanding on how the
tools can be applied in everyday (i.e., practical) healthcare services. This includes supporting key parts of the
Affordable Care Act (such as EMR deployment and meaningful use) and the IHI Triple Aim initiative.

Practical Lean Six Sigma for Healthcare is designed as a convenient, quick reference, and, most importantly,
a step-by-step implementation guide. You can put your finger on any tool within a matter of seconds! Use
the book as follows: Navigate the A3 Report as you progress through the project (starting at the top left of
the report moving vertically to the bottom right). Complete the A3 Report as you learn and apply the tools on
the project by: 1. Go to the tab in the book that corresponds to the A3 Report section you are working on. 2.
Read about the tools for that stage of your project. 3. Apply the appropriate tools. 4. Complete the relevant
section of the A3. 5. Repeat 1 - 4 as you navigate through the A3 and complete your project. Use the Case
Study Example Look-Ahead to direct you to specific pages relative to hospitals, clinics, and/or physician
group practices. Use the Index for quick access to a specific topic or tool. We expect with the knowledge
conveyed in this book, as well as the experiences from your improvement projects, that one day you will



become a Lean Sensei.
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From reader reviews:

William Mayer:

Here thing why this specific Practical Lean Six Sigma for Healthcare - Using the A3 and Lean Thinking to
Improve Operational Performance in Hospitals, Clinics, and Physician Group Practices are different and
reliable to be yours. First of all examining a book is good but it depends in the content than it which is the
content is as scrumptious as food or not. Practical Lean Six Sigma for Healthcare - Using the A3 and Lean
Thinking to Improve Operational Performance in Hospitals, Clinics, and Physician Group Practices giving
you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no book that
similar with Practical Lean Six Sigma for Healthcare - Using the A3 and Lean Thinking to Improve
Operational Performance in Hospitals, Clinics, and Physician Group Practices. It gives you thrill studying
journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is possibly can
be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your technique home by
train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Practical Lean Six
Sigma for Healthcare - Using the A3 and Lean Thinking to Improve Operational Performance in Hospitals,
Clinics, and Physician Group Practices in e-book can be your alternative.

Diana Rush:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How
individuals to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book.
Looking at a book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Practical Lean
Six Sigma for Healthcare - Using the A3 and Lean Thinking to Improve Operational Performance in
Hospitals, Clinics, and Physician Group Practices book because book offers you rich facts and knowledge.
Of course the info in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Donald Murphy:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Practical Lean Six
Sigma for Healthcare - Using the A3 and Lean Thinking to Improve Operational Performance in Hospitals,
Clinics, and Physician Group Practices suitable to you? The actual book was written by well-known writer in
this era. The book untitled Practical Lean Six Sigma for Healthcare - Using the A3 and Lean Thinking to
Improve Operational Performance in Hospitals, Clinics, and Physician Group Practicesis a single of several
books this everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read
this e-book you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know previous to. The author explained
their concept in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to recognise the core of this e-book. This book
will give you a wide range of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world
in this book.



David Whetstone:

You can get this Practical Lean Six Sigma for Healthcare - Using the A3 and Lean Thinking to Improve
Operational Performance in Hospitals, Clinics, and Physician Group Practices by browse the bookstore or
Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for ones
knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by means of written or printed but in addition can you
enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and
searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your reserve.
It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose
appropriate ways for you.
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