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In this book, Ronald Day offers a critical history of the modern tradition of documentation. Focusing on the
documentary index (understood as a mode of social positioning), and drawing on the work of the French
documentalist Suzanne Briet, Day explores the understanding and uses of indexicality. He examines the
transition as indexes went from being explicit professional structures that mediated users and documents to
being implicit infrastructural devices used in everyday information and communication acts. Doing so, he
also traces three epistemic eras in the representation of individuals and groups, first in the forms of
documents, then information, then data. Day investigates five cases from the modern tradition of
documentation. He considers the socio-technical instrumentalism of Paul Otlet, "the father of European
documentation" (contrasting it to the hermeneutic perspective of Martin Heidegger); the shift from
documentation to information science and the accompanying transformation of persons and texts into users
and information; social media's use of algorithms, further subsuming persons and texts; attempts to build
android robots -- to embody human agency within an information system that resembles a human being; and
social "big data" as a technique of neoliberal governance that employs indexing and analytics for purposes of
surveillance. Finally, Day considers the status of critique and judgment at a time when people and their rights
of judgment are increasingly mediated, displaced, and replaced by modern documentary techniques.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Welch:

The book Indexing It All: The Subject in the Age of Documentation, Information, and Data (History and
Foundations of Information Science) has a lot associated with on it. So when you read this book you can get
a lot of benefit. The book was published by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research prior to
write this book. This specific book very easy to read you may get the point easily after scanning this book.

Michael Bradley:

This Indexing It All: The Subject in the Age of Documentation, Information, and Data (History and
Foundations of Information Science) is great guide for you because the content that is certainly full of
information for you who always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This
particular book reveal it details accurately using great arrange word or we can declare no rambling sentences
included. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides
straight forward sentences but hard core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Indexing It
All: The Subject in the Age of Documentation, Information, and Data (History and Foundations of
Information Science) in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous just one.
We can say that no e-book that offer you world in ten or fifteen moment right but this e-book already do that.
So , this really is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that will?

Donald Freeman:

Reading a book to get new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you go through
a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due
to the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books, but
if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
Indexing It All: The Subject in the Age of Documentation, Information, and Data (History and Foundations
of Information Science) will give you new experience in reading a book.

Douglas Johnson:

You can find this Indexing It All: The Subject in the Age of Documentation, Information, and Data (History
and Foundations of Information Science) by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could
possibly to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are
various. Not only through written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In
the modern era similar to now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem.
Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange
yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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