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A unique and compact collection, Ethics at Work: Basic Readings in Business Ethics is an ideal text for
courses in business ethics, business and society, or applied ethics. Bringing together eleven essays by
prominent authors, it features some of the best work in the field and addresses important and provocative
issues. The essays represent diverse ethical and philosophical orientations and have been edited and abridged
to make them more accessible to students. The book opens with two introductory readings that discuss the
role of ethics in business, the relevance and importance of studying business ethics, and the basic moral
responsibilities of businesspeople. The following nine essays examine various controversial moral issues in
business, including corporate downsizing; overseas sweatshops; bribery; whistleblowing; drug testing;
deception in sales; manipulative advertising; insider trading; and our environmental responsibilities. Students
will find interesting connections and illuminating relationships among the contributors' arguments. The
readings are preceded by short introductions and study questions and followed by review questions and
suggestions for further reading.
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From reader reviews:

Jim Weigel:

Typically the book Ethics at Work: Basic Readings in Business Ethics will bring you to the new experience
of reading a book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book you just
read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Ethics at Work: Basic Readings in Business Ethics is much
recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can quicker to
read the book.

Barry Upshaw:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Ethics at Work: Basic Readings in Business
Ethics book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that can be understand
by anyone who have read the book. Written with good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing
skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still doubt Ethics at Work: Basic Readings in Business Ethics
as good book not only by the cover but also from the content. This is one publication that can break don't
ascertain book by its protect, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your
studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Michael Greene:

Reading a book for being new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you read a book
you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, due to the fact
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that you
have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The
Ethics at Work: Basic Readings in Business Ethics will give you a new experience in reading through a
book.

Fred Martinez:

A lot of book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of book Ethics at
Work: Basic Readings in Business Ethics. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed
book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most critical that, you
must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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