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"An extremely important and gracefully written book on a significant and controversial topic. It is the most
thoroughgoing study of Ives's compositional procedures that has yet been attempted."-Larry Starr, author of
A Union of Diversities: Style in the Music of Charles Ives "A unique in-depth study of Ives's works, the most
panoramic view of the music ever written, based on a new and convincing perspective."-H. Wiley Hitchcock,
City University of New York "A unique, pathbreaking, and utterly convincing study of Ives's music."-David
Nicholls, BBC Music Magazine "A well-balanced view of Ives's music. . . . [A] pathbreaking study."-David
Nicholls, Times Literary Supplement "This book should be in the library of every scholar with a serious
interest in Ives's music. . . . Burkholder's writing throughout . . . is refreshingly clear, and his ability to
organize vast amounts of detail into coherent and logical sequences is one of the greatest strengths of the
book, and particularly appropriate to its subject."-Kathryn Bumpass, Notes "The book is well stocked with
music examples and tables, enabling it to be used as a reference work, and has almost 100 pages of notes and
bibliography. It abundantly fulfils its promise 'to help us hear the music better' and enriches our experience
of Ives in a way that is totally sympathetic to the man and his music."-Peter Dickinson, Music & Letters
"Burkholder's remarkable book succeeds in creating a different composite portrait of the musical
consciousness of a great composer."-Judith Tick, American Music Winner of the Choice 1996 Outstanding
Academic Book Award
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From reader reviews:

Claudia Weidner:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled All Made of Tunes: Charles Ives and the Uses of Musical
Borrowing. Try to make book All Made of Tunes: Charles Ives and the Uses of Musical Borrowing as your
buddy. It means that it can to become your friend when you really feel alone and beside those of course make
you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot more confidence
because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience as well as
knowledge with this book.

Anna Vinci:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that concern above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pressured someone or
something that they don't desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book All Made of
Tunes: Charles Ives and the Uses of Musical Borrowing. All type of book is it possible to see on many
resources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Clarissa Holland:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this All Made of Tunes: Charles
Ives and the Uses of Musical Borrowing book as this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the
knowledge in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Eric Kyler:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This kind of book All Made of Tunes: Charles Ives and the Uses of
Musical Borrowing was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book All Made
of Tunes: Charles Ives and the Uses of Musical Borrowing has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until
adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on
there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and
rest. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading which.
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