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This book presents a complete step-by-step guide to endonasal endoscopic skull base surgery, written by
prominent interdisciplinary specialists and reflecting important recent developments in the field. Combining
the fundamentals of skull base anatomy and pathology with current diagnostic and interventional imaging
techniques, Endonasal Endoscopic Surgery of Skull Base Tumors provides a solid clinical foundation for
anyone working in this challenging and evolving specialty.

Special features:

State-of-the-art contributions from international experts in endonasal endoscopic skull base surgery●

A 360 panoramic assessment of skull base pathologies●

Description of basic and advanced endoscopic procedures based on the endonasal corridor system●

Current tumor-specific strategies, including indications and preoperative work-up, endoscopic surgical●

techniques, sequel and potential complications, postoperative care, outcomes, and pearls and pitfalls
Clear and consistent interdisciplinary guidelines for managing the internal carotid artery in skull base●

surgery, allowing the removal of previously inoperable tumors
Surgical outcomes from two of the leading international skull base centers, one in Fulda, Germany●

(formerly headed by Professor Draf), and one joint program at the University of Brescia and University of
Varese, Italy

Complete with 500 full-color photographs, anatomic illustrations, flowcharts and tables, Endonasal
Endoscopic Surgery of Skull Base Tumors offers a practical management approach and sets a new standard
in the field. It is invaluable for all otolaryngologists, head and neck surgeons, neurosurgeons,
neuroradiologists, and pathologists who routinely make diagnostic and therapeutic decisions with regard to
skull base lesions. It is also an essential text and reference for those who are learning how to perform
endonasal endoscopic skull base surgery in a multidisciplinary environment.
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From reader reviews:

Curtis Dugan:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. These are reading
whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will need this Endonasal Endoscopic Surgery of Skull Base Tumors:
An Interdisciplinary Approach.

Jennifer Lorenzo:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress.
Some of you maybe will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know which you should start with. This Endonasal Endoscopic
Surgery of Skull Base Tumors: An Interdisciplinary Approach is our recommendation to help you keep up
with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Joseph Cole:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its include may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in
the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer is usually Endonasal Endoscopic Surgery of Skull Base Tumors:
An Interdisciplinary Approach why because the wonderful cover that make you consider in regards to the
content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or cover. Your
reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Joaquin Bedard:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is named of
book Endonasal Endoscopic Surgery of Skull Base Tumors: An Interdisciplinary Approach. Contain your
knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you
happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one place to
other place.
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