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Constitutional principles are the foundation upon which substantive criminal law, criminal procedure law,
and evidence laws rely. The concepts of due process, legality, specificity, notice, equality, and fairness are
intrinsic to these three disciplines, and a firm understanding of their implications is necessary for a thorough
comprehension of the topic. Criminal Law, Procedure, and Evidence examines the tensions produced by
balancing the ideals of individual liberty embodied in the Constitution against society’s need to enforce
criminal laws as a means of achieving social control, order, and safety.

Relying on his first-hand experience as a law enforcement official and criminal defense attorney, the author
presents issues that highlight the difficulties in applying constitutional principles to specific criminal justice
situations. Each chapter of the text contains a realistic problem in the form of a fact pattern that focuses on
one or more of the classic criminal justice issues to which readers can relate. These problems are presented
from both the point of view of citizens caught up in a police investigation and from the perspective of police
officers attempting to enforce the law within the framework of constitutional protections.

Concepts discussed include

Probable cause●

Search and seizure, stop and frisk, and the exclusionary rule●

Confessions and Miranda warnings●

The right to counsel●

Lineups●

Standards of proof●

Proportionate sentencing●

The right to confront accusers●

Providing a complete view of American legal principles, the book addresses distinct issues as well as the
overlays and connections between the issues. It presents as a cohesive whole the interrelationships between
constitutional principles, statutory criminal laws, procedural law, and common law evidentiary doctrines.
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From reader reviews:

Allan Nguyen:

The reserve untitled Criminal Law, Procedure, and Evidence is the reserve that recommended to you you just
read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to an individual. The language that
article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot
of research when write the book, to ensure the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely
accurate. You also can get the e-book of Criminal Law, Procedure, and Evidence from the publisher to make
you a lot more enjoy free time.

Tony Partee:

The reason why? Because this Criminal Law, Procedure, and Evidence is an unordinary book that the inside
of the publication waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will jolt you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such incredible way makes the
content inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is
good for you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot
of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking
method. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Elizabeth Blake:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specially book entitled
Criminal Law, Procedure, and Evidence the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every single aspect that maybe unknown for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging every single
word written in a e-book then become one form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get
previous to. The Criminal Law, Procedure, and Evidence giving you another experience more than blown
away your head but also giving you useful facts for your better life in this era. So now let us teach you the
relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like
winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Elvia Ecklund:

The book untitled Criminal Law, Procedure, and Evidence contain a lot of information on the item. The
writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy means. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was authored by famous author. The author
will bring you in the new period of time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can
continue reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site as well as order it. Have
a nice read.
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