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All Grown Up: A Boy and his Tiger is a fast-paced 1-act, 5-scene play, which is a parody of a beloved
American comic strip about a boy and his comfort object. The main character Alvin is completing his PhD,
while his love interest Sue has quit college and taken work as a cocktail waitress to financial support him.
Alvin’s father and mother divorced around the time he graduated high school. Dad lives alone and miserably
in the family homestead, while Mom is living with her same-sex partner Martha. Although Alvin is in his
mid 20s, he continues to have his Tiger as an imaginary friend much to Sue’s and his family’s dismay. His
childhood nemesis Roxie and Joe are still branded deeply into his psyche. When Sue wants Alvin to come to
terms with his past and attend a dinner party with Roxie and Joe, the fireworks begin! All Grown Up is a
story about coming to grips with one’s past, standing up for oneself and letting go of an imaginary friend. It
is funny, sad, thought provoking and uses classical music segments to establish mood. Moreover, this play
incorporates a number of elements of Non-tradition Theater, most notably when the set transforms into a
Second Empire drawing room and Alvin becomes the valet in Sartre’s “No Exit”, only to be shut down by
Sue using audience participation.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Watson:

Book is actually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A reserve All Grown Up: A Boy and His
Tiger will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about
every thing. But some of you think in which open or reading a book make you bored. It's not make you fun.
Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or suitable book with you?

Patricia Sax:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important for people. The book All Grown Up: A Boy and His Tiger seemed to be making
you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for
you. The reserve All Grown Up: A Boy and His Tiger is not only giving you considerably more new
information but also to be your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your personal spend time to
read your reserve. Try to make relationship while using book All Grown Up: A Boy and His Tiger. You
never feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Ellis Dunn:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book in
which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of publication you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the All Grown Up: A Boy and His Tiger is
kind of book which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Mary Peterson:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book All Grown Up: A Boy and His Tiger was colourful
and of course has pictures around. As we know that book All Grown Up: A Boy and His Tiger has many
kinds or style. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can
read and think you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it
offers up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading
in which.
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