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As alarming stories about new pathogens like the Ebola virus or Mad Cow Disease fill today's headlines,
scientists face a test of their abilities to contain them. But public health officials face a crisis of their own,
because even when effective treatments become available, efforts to control disease often fall short.

After the Cure was written to improve the prospects for effective management of AIDS and other public
health crises. Martin Levin and Mary Bryna Sanger draw on cases of previous large-scale public health
initiatives to show how management effectiveness can meet threats to public health.

Focusing on AIDS as the most compelling contemporary example of the need for change, the authors
advocate a commonsense approach that seeks to minimize the chances of failure. They encourage health
officials to exercise "strategic skepticism" by developing plans that anticipate potential problems-such as
scientific controversy over a vaccine's effectiveness or media sensationalism-which could arise from flaws in
program design and implementation.

Case studies involving polio, swine flu, childhood immunization, reemergent TB, and the early AIDS
experiences demonstrate the variety of managerial problems that can confront such initiatives. By reviewing
the lessons of these cases, the authors suggest how their approach can be applied to the management of AIDS
and future public health threats. They then present both a critique of the early mismanagement of the AIDS
crisis and a scenario for "the day after an AIDS vaccine is discovered."

Because epidemics are likely to increase, After the Cure clearly demonstrates the importance of anticipating
obstacles to their management through skillful scenario writing. Combining careful analysis with practical
advice, it shows that in the public health arena, management matters as much as medicine.
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From reader reviews:

John Sledge:

Do you considered one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained within the straightway,
hold on guys this aren't like that. This After the Cure: Managing AIDS and Other Public Health Crises
(Studies in Government and Public Policy) (Studies in Government & Public Policy) book is readable by
simply you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading
through experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer
regarding After the Cure: Managing AIDS and Other Public Health Crises (Studies in Government and
Public Policy) (Studies in Government & Public Policy) content conveys thinking easily to understand by
most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different in the form of
it. So , do you continue to thinking After the Cure: Managing AIDS and Other Public Health Crises (Studies
in Government and Public Policy) (Studies in Government & Public Policy) is not loveable to be your top
checklist reading book?

Hazel Gannon:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer could be After the Cure: Managing AIDS and Other Public
Health Crises (Studies in Government and Public Policy) (Studies in Government & Public Policy) why
because the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The
inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to
pick up this book.

Loren Hatmaker:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need
more time to be go through. After the Cure: Managing AIDS and Other Public Health Crises (Studies in
Government and Public Policy) (Studies in Government & Public Policy) can be your answer given it can be
read by you who have those short free time problems.

John Yang:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update of news.
Within this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From



media social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or
just searching for the After the Cure: Managing AIDS and Other Public Health Crises (Studies in
Government and Public Policy) (Studies in Government & Public Policy) when you necessary it?
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